
New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

March 24, 2025

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Monthly Worship Service at Dunlop House Memory Care 

Unit 

Colonial Heights, VA

December 11, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 23, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 23, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

October 24, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

October 24, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

August 29, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

August 29, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

May 30, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

May 30, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

May 30, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

February 22, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

February 22, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

February 22, 2024

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry & Community 

Services Ministry

Christmas Support to the Surrounding Communities  

December 9, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry & Community 

Services Ministry

Christmas Support to the Surrounding Communities  

December 9, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry & Community 

Services Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 18, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry & Community 

Services Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 18, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry & Community 

Services Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 18, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

October 26, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

October 26, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Lunch Preparation at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

October 26, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Initial Visit at The Hope Center

Petersburg, VA 

September 21, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Worship Service at Dunlop House, Colonial Heights, VA

Initial Worship Service 

October 11, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department 

August 1, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department 

August 1, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department 

August 1, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department 

August 1, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department 

August 1, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department - 

August 1, 2023



2023 National Night Out at Colonial Heights Police 

Department - 

August 1, 2023



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Support to the Colonial Heights Food Pantry 

June 30, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Support to the Colonial Heights Food Pantry 

May 12, 2023

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry 

Christmas Angel Tree Support to the Ettrick Community  

December 9, 2022

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 

you came to visit me.” 



New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities  

November 18, 2022

The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 
you came to visit me.” 



The Word of God says in Matthew 25:35-36,  “For I was hungry and you gave me something to 
eat, I was thirsty and you gave me something to drink, I was a stranger and you invited me in,
36 I needed clothes and you clothed me, I was sick and you looked after me, I was in prison and 
you came to visit me.” 

New Day Christian Church Outreach Ministry

Thanksgiving Support to the Surrounding Communities 

November 18, 2022
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